SOLICITATION # 601440000007705 Bid Opening Date: 7/13/2016
VENDOR
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Tine 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Tine 8 Line 9 Line 10
$125.00
110.00 No Bid No Bid 6,400.00 15,495.00 7,000.00
$ $500.00 $ $ $
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Closner Equipment Co. Inc.| $17,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Tine 1 Tine 2 Tine 3 Tine 4 Tine 5 Tine 6 Tine 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tine 10
. $25.00
Big D Tractor Co, LLC DBA See Bid $125.00 $65.00 $75.00 $4,100.00
Frontera Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Equipment/Bluecat $12,300.00
Rentals Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
UNSIGNED Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Tine 1 Tine 2 Tine 3 Tine 4 Tine 5 Tine 6 Tine 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tine 10
$100.00 No Bid $2,550.00 $8,500.00 $4,750.00 $13,000.00 $5,000.00
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
$14,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Holt Texas, LTD. Line 21 Tine 22 Line 23 Tine 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Tine 1 Tine 2 Tine 3 Tine 4 Tine 5 Tine 6 Tine 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tine 10
35.00
iB0.00 No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Crafco Texas, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,150.00 $4,600.00
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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No outside (non-TxDOT) visitors present at the bid opening

[] oOutside visitors present. Sign-in sheet has been created

To create a new page: copy all cells (except Header & Footer) on page 1 and insert into new page.

NOTE: Create new pages BEFORE entering data.

SOLICITATION # 601440000007705 Bid Opening Date: 7/13/2016
VENDOR
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Tine 1 Tine 2 Tine 3 Tine 4 Tine 5 Tine 6 Tine 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tine 10
$1,200.00 $120.00 N/A N/A No Bid $3,966.00 $11,900.00 $3,966.00 $12,000.00 $4,833.00
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
. $14,500.00 $4,833.00 $14,500.00 No Bid No Bid
Romco Equipment Co. Line 21 Tine 22 Line 23 Tine 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Tine 1 Tine 2 Tine 3 Tine 4 Tine 5 Tine 6 Tine 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tine 10
$150.00 See Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $5,675.00
Bane Machinery Fort Line 11 Line :I..2 Line :I..3 Line :I..4 Line :I..5 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
$17,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Worth' LP Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
UNSIGNED
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Tine 1 Tine 2 Tine 3 Tine 4 Tine 5 Tine 6 Tine 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tine 10
No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid $3,650.00 $10,950.00 $4,800.00 $14,400.00 $5,465.00
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
. $16,400.00 $4,650.00 $13,950.00 $1,000.00 $2,450.00
Cooper Equipment Co. Line 21 Tine 22 Line 23 Tine 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Tine 1 Tine 2 Tine 3 Tine 4 Tine 5 Tine 6 Tine 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tine 10
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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No outside (non-TxDOT) visitors present at the bid opening [] Outside visitors present. Sign-in sheet has been created

To create a new page: copy all cells (except Header & Footer) on page 1 and insert into new page. NOTE: Create new pages BEFORE entering data.
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