®

Bid Recording Report

y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000014972 Bid Opening Date: 12/20/2017
TITLE Rental of Traffic Control Equipment without Operator
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 The 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$5,499.95 $2,249.95 No Bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid non-biddable non-biddable
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
. non-biddable $75 weekly $125 mon $125 hourly no bid no bid
Site- Safe Products, LLC Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 The o Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$3,600.00 $900.00 $550.00 $140.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $625.00 non-biddable non-biddable
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
non-biddable $50 Weekly /$150 mon 50. hr $390.00 $130.00
AWP’ Inc. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Tine 2 Tne 3 Line 4 Tine 5 The 6 Tne 7 Tine 8 Tine 9 Tne 10
$3,850.00 $1,350.00 $553.53 $280.06 $2,125.00 $990.00 no bid no bid non-biddable non-biddable
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
United Rentals (North non-biddable no bid No Bid no bid no bid
America) Inc. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Tine 2 The 3 Line 4 Line 5 The 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$4,500.00 $1,900.00 $425.00 $245.00 $900.00 $352.00 $2,800.00 $1,195.00 non-biddable non-biddable
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
non-biddable |  $40 weekly / $40 mon $150.00 $700.00 $299.00
Herc Rentals Inc. Tine 21 Tine 22 Tine 23 Tine 24 Tine 25 Tine 26 Tine 27 Tine 28 Tine 29 Tine 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40

D No outside (non-TxDOT) visitors present at the bid opening Outside visitors present. Sign-in sheet has been created
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Bid Recording Report

y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000014972 Bid Opening Date: 12/20/2017
TITLE Rental of Traffic Control Equipment without Operator
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$4,500.00 $1,500.00 $390.00 $130.00 $700.00 $400.00 $4,500.00 $1,500.00 non-biddable non-biddable
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
non-biddable $1weekly / $5mon $75.00 $690.00 $230.00
Street Smart Rentals, LLC . .
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$6,795.00 $2,725.00 $2,595.00 $995.00 $2,595.00 $995.00 $259.00 $69.00 non-biddable non-biddable
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Analytical Technology non-biddable | $25 Weekly/$75 Monthly $95 hr $1,345.00 $559.00
Cosultants, Inc Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$3,950.00 $1,350.00 $2,100.00 $700.00 $3,300.00 $1,100.00 $900.00 $300.00 non-biddable non-biddable
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Nixon Engeneering,LLC | non-biddable | $45weekly / $135mon $49.50 $3,000.00 | $1,000.00
DBA Nixon Engeneering Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
D No outside (non-TxDOT) visitors present at the bid opening Outside visitors present. Sign-in sheet has been created

To create a new page: copy all cells (except Header & Footer) on page 1 and insert into new page.

Signature

NOTE: Create new pages BEFORE entering data.
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