Bid Recording Report

Y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional ltems
VENDOR UNIT PRICE

Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.25 $3.78 $0.97 $1.80 $1.27 $0.48 $0.37 $0.47 $0.36
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20

Nolans Office Products, Inc.
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.20 $5.33 $1.84 $1.98 $1.56 $0.60 $0.49 $0.53 $0.44
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20

Globe Electric Supply
Company, Inc. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.34 $2.10 $1.06 $0.41 $0.83 $0.52 $0.22 $0.45 $0.35
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Golf Connections, LLC dba
Darling Promo Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.56 $3.62 $1.66 $1.85 $1.30 $0.49 $0.40 $0.47 $0.35
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Beehive Specialty
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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Bid Recording Report

=
y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional Items
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.81 $6.75 $2.07 $0.33 $1.55 $0.65 $0.46 $0.56 $0.42
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Proforma Executive
Marketing Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.35 $3.25 $0.90 No Bid $0.75 $0.35 $0.23 $0.47 $0.19/$0.20
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
TS&J, Inc.
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.50 $1.60 $1.60 $1.30 $1.00 $0.40 $0.34 $0.48 $0.22
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20

TechOrbits, Inc.

Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.50 $1.75 $0.81 $0.40 $0.74 $0.38 $0.25 $0.49 $0.175
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Janco & Winnex, Inc.
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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Bid Recording Report

=
y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional Items
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.408 $2.35 $0.967 $0.773 $0.878 $0.315 $0.196 $0.521 $0.144
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Sierra Group, LLC
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.303 $1.313 $0.586 $0.485 $0.182 $0.303 $0.132 $0.427 $0.162
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Product-Envy, Inc.
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.30 $2.22 $1.04 $0.52 $0.93 $0.37 $0.18 $0.26 $0.09
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Climax Investors (Sea
Shipment) Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.42 $2.22 $1.11 $0.62 $1.00 $0.48 $0.30 $0.38 $0.22
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Climax Investors (Air
Shipment) Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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Bid Recording Report

=
y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional Items
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.74 $3.45 $1.48 $1.75 $1.30 $0.49 $0.41 $0.49 $0.36
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Belmont Swag, LLC
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.405 $3.60 $1.05 $0.84 $0.82 $0.35 $0.25 $0.89 $0.192
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
S&K Associates
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.17 $3.99 $2.37 $1.38 $1.45 $0.43 $0.40 $0.59 $0.32
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
ID Screen Print
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.03 $3.47 $1.70 $1.60 $1.20 $0.48 $0.40 $0.45 $0.38
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Promo King San Antonio
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
[J No outside (non-TxDOT) visitors present at the bid opening Outside visitors present. Sign-in sheet has been created
To create a new page: copy all cells (except Header & Footer) on page 1 and insert into new page. NOTE: Create new pages BEFORE entering data.

Opened By: Brooke Taylor, CTCD

Witnessed By: LeGay Imler, CPPB, CTPM, CTCM

Date: December 06, 2018 Revised: 6/28/2018
Fax Machine Checked: Page 4 of 8




Bid Recording Report

=
y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional Items
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.45 $3.49 $1.39 $0.89 $0.79 $0.45 $0.29 $0.59 $0.25
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Bay Promo, LLC
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.02 $2.84 $0.93 $0.45 $0.46 $0.29 $0.18 $0.437 $0.23
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Austintatious Advertising

Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10

$0.57 $3.84 $0.8848 $0.403 $1.238 $0.525 $0.5018 $0.4326 $0.3125
} ) Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20

V-Quest Office Machines
and Supplies, TTD (Freight
3 . Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Added to Unit Price)

Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10

$0.76 $3.505 $1.489 $1.0125 $1.1312 $0.5024 $0.43 $0.5723 $0.3826
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20

Lemonade Promo (Freight
Added to Unit Price) Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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Bid Recording Report

=
y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional Items
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.55 $4.25 $1.35 $1.68 $1.40 $0.65 $0.45 $0.65 $0.39
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Promo Solutions
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.26 $1.27 $0.87 $0.80 $0.45 $0.40 $0.21 No Bid $0.16
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Elite Textile Trading, LLC
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.38 $2.80 $1.00 $0.42 $0.62 $0.66 $0.18 $0.21 $0.19
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
The Urban Circle, Inc.
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.40 $2.15 $1.15 $1.20 $0.90 $0.45 $0.32 $0.30 $0.28
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Imprint Engine
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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Bid Recording Report

=
y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional Items
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$0.75 $3.21 $1.35 $1.25 $1.06 $0.35 $0.30 $0.32 $0.26
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Nitsom Promos
Manufacturing Corp. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
No Bid No Bid $0.704 $0.574 No Bid $0.152 $0.23 No Bid No Bid
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Artcraft Ad Specialties
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.20 $4.96 $1.80 $1.09 $1.12 $0.54 $0.41 $0.50 $0.38
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
The Specialty Company
dba TSC, Inc. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.23 $4.40 $4.53 $2.05 $0.73 $0.56 $0.68 $0.52 $0.39
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Worldwide Specialty
Advertising, Inc. Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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Bid Recording Report

=
y 4 TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

SOLICITATION # 601440000019087 Bid Opening Date: 12/6/2018
TITLE Safety Promotional Items
VENDOR UNIT PRICE
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
$1.02 $3.85 $1.85 $1.76 $1.31 $0.50 $0.45 $0.46 $0.37
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
4lmprint, Inc.
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
No Bid $1.25 $0.99 $0.85 $1.09 $0.45 $0.36 $0.39 $0.22
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
World of Promotions
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line 7 Line 8 Line 9 Line 10
Line 11 Line 12 Line 13 Line 14 Line 15 Line 16 Line 17 Line 18 Line 19 Line 20
Line 21 Line 22 Line 23 Line 24 Line 25 Line 26 Line 27 Line 28 Line 29 Line 30
Line 31 Line 32 Line 33 Line 34 Line 35 Line 36 Line 37 Line 38 Line 39 Line 40
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